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‘\\\% Stony Brook Medicine

Hospital Plant Operations

To:  Hospital Procurement

From: Plant Operations

Subject: Justification for (2) Ford F250
Date: November 5,201

This requisition is being submitted for the purchase of TWO new Ford F250’s with snow
plows and snow kit. The F250 version is needed for its ability to handle heavy
loads/equipment. This is to add to our fleet so when older equipment is down for repairs
we will be able to keep up with the work load and snow removal. A few of trucks are
old and will require increased maintenance to keep them running, which is not cost
effective at a certain point. In addition, we have additional areas to cover on East
Campus with Bed Tower/ MART.

These trucks are used for snow removal, cleaning up the grounds, debris removal, and
transporting heavy materials. These trucks must be able to handle well in snow and ice
conditions and all weather related conditions.

Veor Pore 1902955

Stony Brook, NY 11794



Messbauer, Kristine | '
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From: Uram, Denise P

Sent: Monday, October 25, 2021 3:21 PM

To: Messbauer, Kristine; Sandaire, Joe; Cullen, Michael: Kelly, Joseph
Cc: Brunet, Liana Lynn; Prudenti, James

Subject: Re: Truck for grounds

Hello,

Funding for the truck was released into acc# 301362-69.

Denise Uram, MBA

Finance and Business Operations
Hospital Facilities and Construction

QW Stony Brook Medicine

Stony Brook University Hospital
101 Nicholls Road

HSC L1, Room 140

Stony Brook, NY 11794-8019
Office: 631.444.7549

Fax:  631.444.9748

From: Messbauer, Kristine <Kristine.Messbauer@stonybrookmedicine.edu>

Sent: Tuesday, October 19, 2021 11:27 AM

To: Kelly, Joseph <Joseph.Kelly@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Sandaire, Joe <Joe.Sandaire@stonybrookmedicine.edu>

Cc: Brunet, Liana Lynn <Liana.Brunet@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Prudenti, James <James.Prudenti@stonybrookmedicine.edu>;
Cullen, Michael <MichaeI.CuIIen@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Uram, Denise P <denise.uram@stonybrookmedicine.edu>
Subject: FW: Truck for grounds

Joe/Joe,
Any updates on quotes/cost for these 2 trucks?

Thanks

----- Original Message-----

From: Messbauer, Kristine

Sent: Monday, September 20, 2021 9:20 AM

To: Kelly, Joseph <joseph.kelly@stonybrookmedicine.edu>

Cc: Brunet, Liana Lynn <Liana.Brunet@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Prudenti, James <james.prudenti@sto.nybrookmedicine.edu>;
Sandaire, Joe <joe.sandaire@stonybrookmedicine.edu>: Cullen, Michael <michael.cullen@stonybrookmedicine.edu>

Subject: RE: Truck for grounds

Joe K., Here are documents from our purchase of an F250 with snow plow in 2018/2019. We bought it from Genesee Valley
Ford. Maybe they can send us a current quote. (This delivery took about 16 weeks.)

Per my notes, some of the Ford dealers didn't want to give us a quote because they know Purchasing will do a mini bid.  On
this last purchase, we submitted a requisition for a penny with the specs of the vehicle. Purchasing did the mini bid and then we
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funded it. Purchasing doesn't want to do the mini bid if we may cancel once we know the cost.

I'm not sure if Mike/Carol want a dollar amount to approve before we proceed with the mini bid.

Thanks
Kris
631-444-3537

From: Cullen, Michael

Sent: Saturday, September 18, 2021 10:37 PM

To: Sandaire, Joe <Joe.Sandaire@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Messbauer, Kristine
<Kristine.Messbauer@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Prudenti, James <James.Prudenti@stonybrookmedicine.edu>
Cc: Brunet, Liana Lynn <Liana.Brunet@stonybrookmedicine.edu>

Subject: Truck for grounds

I received the approval for the trucks on Friday that we requested , If you can get the quotes ASAP we can process Let me know
when we have them so I can get funding in place Hopefully I will be back on Wednesday.

Sent from my iPhone

This e-mail message, including any attachments, is for the sole use of the intended recipient(s) and may contain confidential and
privileged information. Any unauthorized review, use, disclosure or distribution is prohibited. If you are not the intended
recipient, please contact the sender by e-mail and destroy all copies of the original.



Messbauer, Kristine
m

From: Sandaire, Joe

Sent: Monday, November 08, 2021 11:12 AM

To: Uram, Denise P; Messbauer, Kristine

Cc: Brunet, Liana Lynn; Prudenti, James; Cullen, Michael; Kelly, Joseph
Subject: Re: Truck for grounds

Please proceed.....

Get Outlook for Android

From: Uram, Denise P <denise.uram@stonybrookmedicine.edu>
Sent: Monday, November 8, 2021 10:14:55 AM

To: Messbauer, Kristine <Kristine.Messbhauer@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Sandaire, Joe

<Joe.Sandaire @stonyhrookmedicine.edu>

Cc: Brunet, Liana Lynn <Liana.Brunet@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Prudenti, James <James.Prudenti@stonybrookmedicine.edu>;
Cullen, Michael <Michael.CulIeh@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Kelly, Joseph <Joseph.Kelly@stonybrookmedicine.edu>

Subject: Re: Truck for grounds

Good Morning Joe,
Just following up. Please let us know if we can proceed with this.

Kris - Please use the account provided below in this email chain. It is funded for 90K.

Denise Uram, MBA
Director of Finance and Business Operations
Hospital Facilities and Construction

HW Stony Brook Medicine

Stony Brook University Hospital
101 Nicholls Road

HSC L1, Room 140

Stony Brook, NY 11794-801¢
Office: 631.444.7549

Fax:  631.444.9748

From: Messbauer, Kristine <Kristine.Messbauer@stonybrookmedicine.edu>

Sent: Friday, November 5, 2021 1:38 PM

To: Sandaire, Joe <Joe.Sandaire@stonybrookmedicine.edu>

Cc: Brunet, Liana Lynn <Liana.Brunet@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Prudenti, James <lames.Prudenti@stonybrookmedicine.edu>;
Cullen, Michael <Michael.Cullen@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Uram, Denise P <denise.uram@stonybrookmedicine.edu>; Kelly,
Joseph <Joseph.Kelly@stonybrookmedicine.edu>

Subject: RE: Truck for grounds

JoeS., Perour conversation yesterday, we have written up the specifications for TWO Ford F250’s.  Please confirm that we
can submit the requisition for Purchasing to proceed with the mini bid. Once the bid is complete, Purchasing will notify of us of
the actual cost and Denise can transfer the funding to us. The total funding available is $91k.
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